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PROJECT NAME: Dunne Technology Academy Modernization 
ADDRESS: 10845 South Union Avenue 
CONTRACT NO.: C1566 
PROJECT NO.: 05440 
PROJECT TYPE: Annex & Renovation 

ADVERTISEMENT DATE: February 13, 2015 
NO. OF ADDENDUMS: 1 
ADDENDUM DATES: 2/27/15                                
BID DUE DATE: March 5, 2015             
BID OPENING TIME: 11:00 AM        

ELIGIBLE BIDDERS 

  SCOPE A AND SCOPE B SCOPE A   

PRE-QUALIFIED BIDDERS TOTAL BASE 
BID 

AWARD 
CRITERIA 
FIGURE 

TOTAL BASE 
BID 

AWARD 
CRITERIA 
FIGURE 

ALTERNATE Document Compliance/Notes 

Powers and Sons Construction Company, Inc. $6,826,000.00 $6,498,352.00* $4,842,000.00 $4,609,584.00* $350,000.00 
 Bid Bond  
 Addendum Acknowledgement  
  Statement of Bidders Qualifications  
 Affidavit of Non-Collusion 

Path Construction Company, Inc. $6,796,000.00 $6,515,325.20 $4,937,000.00 $4,733,101.90 $620,000.00 
 Bid Bond  
 Addendum Acknowledgement  
  Statement of Bidders Qualifications  
 Affidavit of Non-Collusion 

Wight Construction Services, Inc. $6,821,430.00 $6,548,572.80 $5,153,420.00 $4,947,283.20 $600,000.00 
 Bid Bond  
 Addendum Acknowledgement  
  Statement of Bidders Qualifications  
 Affidavit of Non-Collusion 

K.R. Miller Contractors, Inc. $7,097,000.00 $6,756,344.00 $5,410,000.00 $5,150,320.00 $557,000.00 
 Bid Bond  
 Addendum Acknowledgement  
  Statement of Bidders Qualifications  
 Affidavit of Non-Collusion 

Blinderman Construction Company, Inc. $7,607,000.00 $7,339,234.00 $5,682,000.00 $5,481,994.00 No Bid 
 Bid Bond  
 Addendum Acknowledgement  
  Statement of Bidders Qualifications  
 Affidavit of Non-Collusion 

Burling Builders, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  

Friedler Construction Company NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  

The George Sollitt Construction Company NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  

Old Veteran Construction, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  

Tyler Lane Construction, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  

*Corrected Figures – Scope A & B – Award Criteria Figure $6,498,352.00/ Scope A Only – Award Criteria Figure $4,609,584.00. 
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INELIGIBLE BIDDERS  

  SCOPE A AND SCOPE B SCOPE A   
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FIGURE 

TOTAL BASE 
BID 

AWARD 
CRITERIA 
FIGURE 

ALTERNATE Document Compliance/Notes 

The Lombard Company                                

Paschen Milhouse Joint Venture II                                

Wm. A. Randolph, Inc.                                

This Bid Tabulation is intended to reflect the APPARENT Lowest Responsive and Responsible Bidder. All bids shall be reviewed for adherence with PBC Procurement and Bidding Requirements.   
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