
 
PUBLIC BUILDING COMMISSION OF CHICAGO 
DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT SERVICES 

BID TABULATION 
www.pbcchicago.com 

 
Public Building Commission  •  Richard J.  Daley  Center  •  50  West  Washington, Room 200  •  Chicago, Illinois 60602  •  Tel: 312-744-3090  •  Fax: 312-744-3572 

 
 

PROJECT NAME: Wildwood World Magnet School Annex/Renovation 
ADDRESS: 6950 N Hiawatha Avenue 
CONTRACT NO.: C1560 
PROJECT NO.: 05710 
PROJECT TYPE: New Construction/Renovation 

ADVERTISEMENT DATE: June 3, 2014 
NO. OF ADDENDUMS: 4 
ADDENDUM DATES: 6/18/14  6/23/14   6/26/14  6/30/14          
BID DUE DATE: 7/1/14             
BID OPENING TIME: 11:00 AM        

PRE-QUALIFIED BIDDERS TOTAL BASE BID AWARD CRITERIA 
FIGURE 

BID BOND 
(5% of bid) 

Statement of 
Contractor’s 
Qualification 

Affidavit of Non-
Collusion Addendum 

Paschen Millhouse Joint Venture III 
5515 North East River Road 
Chicago, IL  60656 

$10,618,000.00 $10,180,007.50*     

Burling Builders, Inc. 
44 W. 60th Street 
Chicago, IL  60621 

$10,964,000.00 $10,476,102.00     

Old Veteran Construction, Inc. 
10942 South Halsted Street 
Chicago, IL  60628 

$11,129,600.00 $10,595,379.20*     

Wight Construction Services, Inc. 
211 North Clinton Street, Suite 300 
Chicago, IL  60661 

$11,175,000.00 $10,719,060.00     

Friedler Construction Company 
2525 North Elston, D-240 
Chicago, IL  60647 

$11,278,000.00 $10,770,490.00     

K.R. Miller Construction, Inc. 
1624 Colonial Parkway 
Inverness, IL  60067-4732 

$11,357,000.00 $10,902,720.00     

Blinderman Construction Company 
8501 West Higgins, Suite 320 
Chicago, IL  60631 

$11,370,000.00 $10,889,049.00     

This Bid Tabulation is intended to reflect the APPARENT Lowest Responsive and Responsible Bidder. All bids shall be reviewed for adherence with PBC Procurement and Bidding Requirements.  
*Corrected Figure.  
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PBC – BID TABULATION – WILDWOOD WORLD MAGNET SCHOOL ANNEX & RENOVATION_C1560 
(continued) 
 
 

PRE-QUALIFIED BIDDERS TOTAL BASE BID AWARD CRITERIA 
FIGURE 

BID BOND 
(5% of bid) 

Statement of 
Contractor’s 
Qualification 

Affidavit of Non-
Collusion Addendum 

IHC Construction Companies, LLC. 
1500 Executive Drive 
Elgin, IL  60123 

$11,564,487.00 $11,072,997.00     

All-Bry Construction Company NO BID NO BID     

George Sollitt Construction Company NO BID NO BID     

Gilbane Building Company NO BID NO BID     

Henry Bros. Company NO BID NO BID     

This Bid Tabulation is intended to reflect the APPARENT Lowest Responsive and Responsible Bidder. All bids shall be reviewed for adherence with PBC Procurement and Bidding Requirements.   
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