

**PUBLIC BUILDING COMMISSION OF CHICAGO  
DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT SERVICES  
BID TABULATION**

www.pbcchicago.com



Public Building Commission • Richard J. Daley Center • 50 West Washington, Room 200 • Chicago, Illinois 60602 • Tel: 312-744-3090 • Fax: 312-744-3572

**PROJECT NAME:** Southwest Area School  
**ADDRESS:** 6018 South Karlov Avenue, Chicago, IL 60629  
**CONTRACT NO.:** C1565  
**PROJECT NO.:** 05660  
**PROJECT TYPE:** New Construction

**ADVERTISEMENT DATE:** March 3, 2015  
**NO. OF ADDENDUMS:** 1  
**ADDENDUM DATES:** 3/27/15  
**BID DUE DATE:** 4/2/15  
**BID OPENING TIME:** 11:00 AM

PRE-QUALIFIED BIDDERS	BASE CONSTRUCTION SCHEDULE TOTAL BASE BID	BASE CONSTRUCTION SCHEDULE AWARD CRITERIA FIGURE	ACCELERATED CONSTRUCTION SCHEDULE TOTAL BASE BID	ACCELERATED CONSTRUCTION SCHEDULE AWARD CRITERIA FIGURE	Document Compliance/Notes
<b>ELIGIBLE</b>					
K.R. Miller Contractors, Inc. 1624 Colonial Parkway Inverness, IL 60077	\$35,987,000.00	\$34,248,262.23	\$37,057,000.00	\$35,278,264.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Bid Bond <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Addendum Acknowledgement <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Statement of Bidders Qualifications <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Affidavit of Non-Collusion
Blinderman/Meccor JV 8501 West Higgins, Suite 320 Chicago, IL 60631	\$35,731,103.00	\$34,248,262.00*	\$37,004,039.00	\$35,708,897.64*	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Bid Bond <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Addendum Acknowledgement <input type="checkbox"/> Statement of Bidders Qualifications <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Affidavit of Non-Collusion
Paschen Milhouse JV II 5515 N East River Road Chicago, IL 60656	\$35,691,000.00	\$34,218,746.00*			<input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Bid Bond <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Addendum Acknowledgement <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Statement of Bidders Qualifications <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Affidavit of Non-Collusion
Sollitt/Oakley Joint Venture 7815 S Claremont Avenue Chicago, IL 60620	\$36,452,149.00	\$34,793,576.22	\$39,543,602.00	\$37,744,368.11	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Bid Bond <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Addendum Acknowledgement <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Statement of Bidders Qualifications <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Affidavit of Non-Collusion
Wm. A. Randolph, Inc.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	-
<b>INELIGIBLE</b>					
Power/Old Veteran Construction JV	-	-	-	-	-
Tyler Lane Construction, Inc.	-	-	-	-	-

This Bid Tabulation is intended to reflect the APPARENT Lowest Responsive and Responsible Bidder. All bids shall be reviewed for adherence with PBC Procurement and Bidding Requirements.

\*Corrected figures:

- Blinderman/Meccor JV - Base Construction Schedule Award Criteria Figure was off by \$0.23. Corrected amount is as reflected above.
- Blinderman/Meccor JV - Accelerated Construction Schedule Award Criteria Figure was off by \$799.64. Corrected amount is as reflected above.
- Paschen Milhouse JV II - Base Construction Schedule Award Criteria Figure was off by \$0.25. Corrected amount is as reflected above.